
REGULAR SESSION TUESDAY APRIL 8, 2008 

The Board of Huron County Commissioners met this date in Regular Session.  Roll being called found the 

following members present: Gary W. Bauer, Ralph A. Fegley, Mike Adelman, absent.  

 

Pursuant to Ohio Revised Code Section 305.14 the Record of the Proceedings of the April 3, 2008         

meeting(s) were presented to the Board. Ralph A. Fegley made the motion to waive the reading of the 

minutes of the April 3, 2008 meeting(s) and approve as presented.  Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion. 

Voting was as follows: 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-121  

 

IN THE MATTER OF CERTIFYING CLAIMS SCHEDULES TO THE HURON COUNTY 

AUDITOR FOR PAYMENT: 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, as per Ohio Revised Code 305.10, a resolution must be made by the Board of Huron County 

Commissioners to accompany the Claims Schedule to the Huron County Auditor’s Office for payment;  

 now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners does hereby approve Claim 

Schedule C 08-12 and authorize the Huron County Auditor to make the necessary warrants; and further  

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

Ralph A. Fegley seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as 

follows: 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 
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08-122 

 

IN THE MATTER OF AMENDING RESOLUTION 08-110 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, resolution 08-110 in the matter of REVIEWING AND CHANGING MAINTENANCE 

BASES AND SETTING A DATE FOR HEARING ON THE CHANGES IN THE MAINTENANCE 

BASE FOR THE STACKLIN-STOCKMASTER #108 (11-780) JOINT COUNTY GROUP 

needs to be amended;                                                                                                                       and 

 

WHEREAS, the time of the hearing was set for April 29, 2008 at 1:00 p.m. and needs to be changed to 

April 29, 2008 at2:00 p.m.;                                                                                                  now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners amends Resolution 08-110 to set 

the date and time for April 29, 2008 at 2:00 p.m.                                                                        and further  

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-123 

 

IN THE MATTER OF RESCINDING RESOLUTION 08-109 REGULAR SESSION OF THE 

BOARD APRIL 1, 2008 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the Board to rescind Resolution 08-109 IN THE MATTER OF 

APPROVAL OF A SUBRECIPIENT AGREEMENT WITH THE OHIO DEPARTMENT OF JOB AND 

FAMILY SERVICES; now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby rescinds Resolution 08-109 

approved April 1, 2008, and recorded in Commissioners’ Journal, Volume 85; and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 
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Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-124 

 

RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF HURON COUNTY TO SIGN THE 

OHIO DEPARTMENT OF JOB AND FAMILY SERVICES SUBGRANT AGREEMENT 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution:   

 

WHEREAS, amended Substitute House Bill 119 of the 127th General Assembly, the biennial budget bill, 

makes counties subgrantees of federal human services funding; and 

  

WHEREAS, Am. Sub. H.B. 119 requires counties to enter into subgrant agreements with the Ohio 

Department of Job and Family Services (“ODJFS”) by July 1, 2008; and 

 

WHEREAS; in order for counties to continue to receive human services funding through the state, and 

continue to provide the vital  services needed by Ohio’s most vulnerable population, the counties must sign 

these subgrant agreements; and 

 

WHEREAS, the subgrant agreement includes language to help ensure counties remain in compliance with 

federal and state law, such as provisions that require ODJFS to provide technical assistance, training, and 

monitoring to counties; now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Commissioners of Huron County that the Board will sign the 

ODJFS subgrant agreement;              and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

                                              

Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-125 

 

IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING BIDS FOR THE APPLICATION OF HOT MIX ASPHALT 

IN HURON COUNTY 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved for the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, the Huron County Engineer received approval to seek bids for resurfacing various roads with 

hot mix type asphaltic cement pursuant to Resolution #08-073, with notice placed in a newspaper of 

general circulation March 7th,  2008 and posted on the County’s website in keeping with 307.86 of the 

Revised Code;                                                     and 

 

WHEREAS, bids were received and opened on Wednesday, April 2nd, 2008 at 9:30 a.m. with the 

following prices submitted by the firms listed below: 

 

MAINLINE  ERIE  GERKEN       A.J. RILEY 

404 w/Rap  $50.00     $51.98  No Bid 

404 w/o Rap  $52.95     $54.75  $61.00 
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402 w/Rap  $47.50     $49.00  No Bid 

402 w/o Rap  $49.50     $51.75  $56.82 

 

LESS THAN 250 TONS 

404 w/Rap  $72.00     $78.00  No Bid 

404 w/o Rap  $74.00     $80.75  $69.44 

 

402 w/Rap  $68.00     $75.25  No Bid 

402 w/o Rap  $69.50     $78.00  $65.00 

 

251-500 TONS 

404 w/Rap  $63.00     $64.50  No Bid 

404 w/o Rap  $65.00     $67.25  $66.44 

 

402 w/Rap  $58.00     $61.75  No Bid 

402 w/o Rap  $60.00     $64.50  $61.82 

 

WHEREAS, each proposal has been reviewed and examined by the Huron County Engineer’s Office as to 

compliance to the Specifications, General Terms, Requirements and Conditions and prices submitted; 

                                                        now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners does hereby award the bid for hot mix asphalt 

cement w/rap and w/o rap to: 

 

#404 Mainline w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop @ $50.50  

      w/o R.A.P. Erie Blacktop @ $52.95  

 

#402 Mainline w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop @ $47.50  

      w/o R.A.P. Erie Blacktop @ $49.50  

 

Efforts Requiring Less than 250 Tons 

#404  w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc @  $72.00 

   w/o R.A.P. A.J. Riley, Inc. @ $69.44 

#402  w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc. @  $68.00 

   w/o R.A.P. A.J. Riley, Inc. @ $69.44 

 

Efforts Requiring 251-500 Tons 

#404  w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc. @  $63.00 

   w/o R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc. @ $65.00 

 

#402  w/R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc. @  $58.00 

   w/o R.A.P. Erie Blacktop, Inc. @ $60.00 

 

with A.J. Riley, Inc., 151 Akron Road, Norwalk, OH  44857; and Erie Blacktop, Inc., 4507 Tiffin Avenue, 

Sandusky, OH  44870 with award subject to the terms and conditions bid;              and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-126 

 

 IN THE MATTER OF APPROVING OF A CHANGE ORDER NO. MB-2 WITH DUNDOR 
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PLUMBING & HEATING FOR THE HURON COUNTY ENERGY DESIGN PROJECT 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, a change order has been presented for the Huron County Energy Design Project, Courthouse 

Complex;                  and 

 

WHEREAS, add unit heater in Courthouse basement and add change out and rebalance four (4) cartridge 

circuit setters at 22 East Main Street;                                                                                                         and 

 

WHEREAS, this work will be performed for the cost of four thousand six hundred ten dollars ($4,610.00) 

contract time unchanged; and  

 

WHEREAS, the sum of $4,610.00 is hereby added to the contract price of $59,130.00 the new adjusted 

contract price to date thereby is $63,740.00; now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of the change order 

No. MB-2 as submitted with Dundore Plumbing & Heating. as listed above; and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that it will change the amount of the contract from $59,130.00 to $63,740.00;  

and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

 Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-127 

 

IN THE MATTER OF APPROVING OF THE STATUS REPORT FOR CDBG GRANTS B-C-06-

036-1 AND B-C-06-036-2 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, a Status Report for B-C-06-036-1 and B-C-06-036-2 has been prepared by  CT Consultant, 

Inc., and submitted to the Board of Huron County Commissioners for their approval; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Board of Huron County Commissioners has reviewed the Status Report for B-C-06-036-

1 and B-C-06-036-2 has found that to the best of their knowledge the data in the report as attached herein 

has been verified to be true and correct as of the date of this report;  now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of the Status 

Report for B-C-06-036-1 and B-C-06-036-2;  and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Status Report for B-C-06-036-1 and B-C-06-036-2 be made a part of this 

resolution hereof the same as if fully written herein; and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
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       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

08-128 

 

IN THE MATTER OF ACCEPTING THE RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE TAX INCENTIVE 

REVIEW COUNCIL (TIRC)  

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved the adoption of the following resolution:   

 

WHEREAS,  the Board of Huron County Commissioners is in receipt of recommendations from ; Willard 

TIRC; Plymouth TIRC; Monroeville TIRC; Norwalk TIRC; New London TIRC  for the tax abatement 

agreements; and 

  

WHEREAS, per the Ohio Revised Code Section 5709.85(E) the legislative authority is required to meet 

within sixty (60) days after receiving the TIRC recommendations to either accept or not to accept the TIRC 

recommendations.; and 

 

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the Huron County Board of Commissioners to accept the recommendations 

of the above mentioned TIRC Committees; now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby accepts the 

recommendations of the above mentioned TIRC committees as attached hereto and incorporated herein; 

 and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 

Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 

to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 

Revised Code. 

 

Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

IN THE MATTER OF TRAVEL 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved to approve the following travel requests this day.  Gary W. Bauer seconded the 

motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

/Gary Ebinger, Auditor’s Office, on April 22-23, 2008, to Montgomery County, Ohio, to provide training 

to OWMA, SW District. 

Roland Tkach, Auditor, on April 11, 2008, to Bowling Green, Ohio, for AOS Advisory Board. 
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IN THE MATTER OF REQUEST FOR LEAVE 

Lon Burton/Mechanic/sick/11:00 a.m. – 3:30 p.m. April 3, 2008. 

Darwin Pesnell/Buildings & Grounds/sick/8:00 a.m.  March 31, 2008- 4:30 p.m. April 1, 2008.  

 

Administrator/Clerk’s Report 

Discussion was had in regards to the health insurance holiday notice to be sent to employees.  It was 

decided to wait until Thursday to send out. 

 

Assistant Prosecutor’s Report 

Discussion was had in regards to the highway department contract that she was reviewing stated that it will 

need to have the insertion in regards to not donating to any campaign funds for the elected official. 

 

At 10:00 a.m.  Ralph A. Fegley moved to enter into Executive Sessions ORC 121.22 (G) (1) ) to 

consider the appointment, employment, dismissal, discipline, promotion, demotion, or compensation of a 

public employee or official, or the investigation of charges or complaints against a public employee, 

official, licensee, or regulated individual; ORC 121.22 (G) (4) preparation for, conducting, or reviewing 

negotiations or bargaining sessions for public employees, concerning employee compensation or other 

terms and conditions of employment. Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its 

adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

 

At 10:30 a.m. Ralph A. Fegley moved to end Executive Sessions ORC 121.22 (G) (1) & ORC 121.22 (G) 

(4).  Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as 

follows: 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

• Action taken. 

 

Ralph A. Fegley moved to increase the hours of work from part time 20 hours to 30 hours per week for 

the Human Resource Director, Sue Bommer.  Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being 

called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 

OTHER BUSINESS 

 

Gary Bauer discussed the lease with Tom Jarrett, of Northern Ohio Antique Mall at 22 East Main Street, 

county building.  After this discussion the board agreed to have Daivia Kasper talk to Mr. Jarrett in regards 

to this lease.  

 

Mr. Bauer and Mr. Fegley also discussed upcoming events and meeting for the calendar. 

 

Mr. Fegley discussed the vehicle ADHOC committee meeting.  Reviewed a list of discussion topics for the 

meeting along with a form to check a car out for use. Also a discussion was had in regards to the 

confiscated vehicles and what needs to be done before they belong to the county.  Sheriff Sutherland stated 

that he would like to give one of the vehicles to the fire departments to use for an upcoming exercise.  The 

car will be cut up and then can be hauled away for scrap.   

 

At 11:35 a.m.   Ralph A. Fegley moved to enter into Executive Session ORC 121.22 (G) (1)  to consider 

the appointment, employment, dismissal, discipline, promotion, demotion, or compensation of a public 

employee or official, or the investigation of charges or complaints against a public employee, official, 

licensee, or regulated individual.  Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its 

adoption, the vote resulted as follows:   

       Absent – Mike Adelman 

       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 

       Aye – Ralph A. Fegley 
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At 11:55 a.m.  Ralph A. Fegley moved to adjourn.  Gary W. Bauer seconded the motion.  The meeting 

stood adjourned. 

 

IN THE MATTER OF OPEN SESSION 

 

The Huron County Commissioners hereby attest that all actions and deliberations of the Board legally 

required to be public were conducted in an open session on this date and that the foregoing minutes 

represent the official action of the Board. 

 

IN THE MATTER OF CERTIFICATION 

 

The Clerk to the Board does hereby attest that the foregoing is a true and correct record of all actions taken 

by the Board of Huron County Commissioners on April 8, 2008.                

 

IN THE MATTER OF ADJOURNING 

 

The meeting was called to order at 9:00 a.m.  With no further business to come before the Board, the 

meeting was adjourned at 11:55 a. m.    

 

 

 

Signatures on File.  


